

**Bid Tabulation**

Purchase of Water Treatment Chemicals  
 Polyaluminum Chloride  
 Sodium Hypochlorite  
 Sodium Hydroxide  
 Citric Acid  
 Ortho Polyphosphate

Monday, May 23, 2022 at 1:30 p.m.  
 Saratoga County Water Authority  
 260 Butler Road, Gansevoort, NY 12831

	Polyaluminum Chloride (Price per gallon)	Sodium Hypochlorite (Price per gallon)		Sodium Hydroxide - 25% (Price per gallon)	Citric Acid (Price per gallon)	Ortho-Polyphosphate (Price per gallon)	Muriatic Acid (Price per gallon)
<b>Vendor</b>	5,000 gal.	4,000 gal.	100 gal.	4,000 gal.	300 gal. totes	275 gal. totes	320 gal. totes
Slack Chemical Co. 21 Grande Blvd. Saratoga Springs, NY 12866	\$3.490	\$1.398	\$9.490	\$2.374	\$13.440	\$14.430	\$3.44
Holland Company, Inc. 153 Howland Avenue Adams, MA 01220	\$2.56	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
USALCO 2601 Cannery Avenue Baltimore, MD 21226	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Surpass Chemical Co., Inc. P.O. Box 4165 Albany, NY 12204	No Bid	\$1.854	\$4.360	\$2.324	\$17.240	No Bid	\$2.44
Coyne Chemical Co. 3015 State Road Croydon, PA 19021	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.920	No Bid
Kuehne Chemical Co. 86 N. Hackensack Ave. Kearny, NJ 07032	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Shannon Chemical Co. 602 Jeffers Circle, Ste. 116 Exton, PA 19341-2539	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.37	\$16.37	No Bid
2020 Pricing	\$1.73	\$0.836	\$1.81	\$1.109	\$4.890	\$6.48	New Bid
Existing Supplier	Holland Chemical	Surpass	Surpass	Surpass	Surpass	Slack Chem	
Proposed Supplier	Holland Chemical	Slack	Surpass	Surpass	Slack Chem	Slack Chem	Surpass