

**Bid Tabulation**

Purchase of Water Treatment Chemicals  
 Polyaluminum Chloride  
 Sodium Hypochlorite  
 Sodium Hydroxide  
 Citric Acid  
 Ortho Polyphosphate

Friday, May 19, 2017 at 1:30 p.m.  
 Saratoga County Water Authority  
 260 Butler Road, Gansevoort, NY 12831

	Poyaluminum Chloride (Price per gallon)	Sodium Hypochlorite (Price per gallon)		Sodium Hydroxide - 25% (Price per gallon)	Citric Acid (Price per gallon)	Ortho-Polyphosphate (Price per gallon)
<b>Vendor</b>	5,000 gal.	4,000 gal.	100 gal.	4,000 gal.	300 gal. totes	275 gal. totes
Slack Chemical Co. 21 Grande Blvd. Saratoga Springs, NY 12866	\$1.285	\$0.785	\$1.795	\$0.920	\$4.950	\$7.050
Holland Company, Inc. 153 Howland Avenue Adams, MA 01220	\$1.07	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions Inc. 3211 Clinton Pkwy. Ct. Lawrence, KS 66047	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Surpass Chemical Co., Inc. P.O. Box 4165 Albany, NY 12204	No Bid	\$0.767	\$1.627	\$0.938	\$5.925	No Bid
Coyne Chemical Co. 3015 State Road Croydon, PA 19021	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.636	\$7.698
Kuehne Chemical Co. 86 N. Hackensack Ave. Kearny, NJ 07032	No Bid	\$1.22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Gulbrandsen Technologies 2 Main Street Clinton, NJ 08809	\$1.130	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Shannon Chemical Co. 602 Jeffers Circle, Ste. 116 Exton, PA 19341-2539	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.24	\$5.24
USALCO 2601 Cannery Ave. Baltimore, MD 21226	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Geo Specialties 9213 Arch Street Pike Little Rock, AR 72206	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Thatcher Company 1905 Fortune Road Salt Lake City, UT 84104	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5.9869	No Bid
2014 Pricing	\$1.70	\$0.790	\$1.64	\$0.895	\$6.100	\$6.84
Existing Supplier	Holland Chemical	Surpass	Surpass	Slack Chemical	Surpass Chemical	Slack Chemical
Proposed Supplier						